
 

14"1 February, 2020

M/s.Bombay Stock Exchange Ltd. M/sNational Stock Exchange of India Ltd.

Phiroze Jeejeebhoy Towers, 25». Floor Regd. Office : ”Exchange Plaza”

Dalal Street, Mumbai - 400 001. Bandra (East), Mumbai - 400 051.
Scrip Code: 504220 Symbol : WSI

Dear Sir,

Sub: Unaudited quarterly results (Standalone and Consolidated) for the Third quarter/ Nine
months ended 315t December 2019- submission of clarification on the opinion expressed by
Auditors in their Limited Review Report

The Auditors in their Limited Review Report on the Statement of Unaudited Standalone
Financial Results for the Third quarter/ Nine months ended 315k December 2019, interaiia, have
reported as under :

Quote

"The company’s net worth has been completely eroded. The accumulated losses in the reporting

period, amounts to Rs. 49218.77 lakhs (Previous year ended 31.03.2019 Rs.43471.57 lakhs) and the

turnover during the period ended 315t December 2019 is Rs.75.34 lakhs (Previous year ended

31.03.2019 Rs. 72.64 lakhs).

We draw attention to Statement of Profit & Loss account for the nine—month period ended 315t

December, 2019, which indicates that the company has incurred a net loss of INR 5747.19 Lakhs and, as

of that date, the company’s current liabilities exceeded its current assets. The Statement of Profit & Loss

account also indicate that company has been incurring net losses for the previous years. These events

indicate that a material uncertainty exists that may cast significant doubt on the company's ability to

continue as a going concern. However, the Company's Statement of unaudited financial results have

been prepared using the going concern basis of accounting”.

Unquote

For the above referred observation of the Auditors, the company provides the clarifications namely that

the Company has Project business vertical which is currently functioning at a low scale because of

inadequacy of funds. The opportunity and potential for scaling up exist once the Balance Sheet is

restructured. Hence, the company continues to prepare its Accounts and the Statement of Unaudited

Financial Results using going concern basis of accounting. U L 0
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The Auditors in their Limited Review Report on the Statement of Consolidated Unaudited Financial

Results for the Third quarter/Nine months ended 31$t December 2019, interalia, have reported as

under:

Quote

”The Parent company’s net worth has been completely eroded. The accumulated losses of the
parent company in the reporting period, amounts to Rs. 49218.77 lakhs (Previous year ended
31.03.2019 Rs.43471.57 lakhs) and the tumover during the period ended 31$t December 2019 is
Rs.75.34 lakhs (Previous year ended 31.03.2019 Rs. 72.641akhs).

We draw attention to Statement of Profit & Loss account of the parent company for the nine-
month period ended 315t December, 2019, which indicates that the parent company has
incurred a net loss of INR 5747.19 lakhs and, as of that date, the parent company's current
liabilities exceeded its current assets. The Statement of Profit & Loss account also indicate that
parent company has been incurring net losses for the previous years. These events indicate that
a material uncertainty exists that may cast significant doubt on the parent company’s ability to
continue as a going concern. However, the Parent Company’s Statement of unaudited financial
results have been prepared using the going concern basis of accounting".

Unquote

For the above referred observation of the Auditors, the company provides the clarifications
namely that the Parent Company has Project business vertical which is currently functioning at
a low scale because of inadequacy of funds. The opportunity and potential for scaling up exist
once the Balance Sheet is restructured. Hence, the parent company continues to prepare its
Accounts and the Statement of Unaudited Financial Resulm using going concern basis of

accounting.

Thanking you

Yours faithfully
for W.S. INDUSTRIES (INDIA) LIMITED

#44W
J.Sridharan
Director
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